Bid Tabulation
ITB 77-21 "Asphalt (Emulsion)”
Dorothea Robinson, Principal Buyer
Email: robinsond@jccal.org

Ergon Asphalt & Emulsion Inc.

Item No. [UOM Per(  Description Price Extended Pricing
Gallon

Grade CRS-2: 1.8300

1 300,000 |Super Fund Charge: 0.0015 $549,450.00
Total Price: 1.8315
Grade CRS-2H: 1.8300

2 300,000 |Super Fund Charge: 0.0015 $549,450.00
Total Price: 1.8315
Grade CRS-2P: 2.1300

3 100,000 [Super Fund Charge: 0.0015 $213,150.00
Total Price: 2.1315
Grade RS-2: NO BID

4 300,000 |Super Fund Charge: $0.00
Total Price: 0
Grade MP-1: NO BID

5 300,000 |Super Fund Charge: $0.00
Total Price: 0
Grade MC-250: NO BID

6 3,000 |Super Fund Charge: $0.00
Total Price: 0
Grade MC-70: NO BID

7 300,000 |Super Fund Charge: $0.00
Total Price: 0
Grade CRS-2HP: 2.1300

8 300,000 |Super Fund Charge: 0.0015 $639,450.00
Total Price: 2.1315
Grade CQS 1HP 3%
Latex Tack: NO BID

9 300,000 Super Fund Charge: $0.00
Total Price: 0
Grade Tackless
Tack: 2.6000

10 300,000 Super Fund Charge: 0.0015 $780,450.00
Total Price: 2.6015
Grade MC-70: NO BID

11 300,000 |Super Fund Charge: $0.00
Total Price: 0
Grade CRS-2HP: 2.1300

12 300,000 |Super Fund Charge: 0.0015 $639,450.00
Total Price: 2.1315
Grade CQS 1HP 3%
Latex Tack: NO BID

13 300,000 Super Fund Charge: $0.00
Total Price: 0
Grade CRS-1H: 2.6000

14 300,000 |Super Fund Charge: 0.0015 $780,450.00
Total Price: 2.6015

Grand Total: $4,151,850.00
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Delivery is guaranteed not later than ___days after order date. | 1

***Pricing is based on delivery of full truck transport quantities***

Demurrage: 2 hours free; $85/hr thereafter

Pump Charge: $85 - if needed

Drop Tanker: $500/mo (30 days); $125/week thereafter

Servicing other jursidictions: (Shelby, Tuscaloosa, Bibb,Chilton,

Winston,Walker, Blount, St. Clair, Pickens) NO BID
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